
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

Multimedia artist VNCCII is sending her Sci-Fi Novel to the Moon and 
Music to Deep Space 

  
Boundary-pushing multimedia music artist VNCCII is set to send new original music to 
Deep Space as well as her science fiction novel to the Moon. The music lives within 
VNCCII’s expansive sci-fi universe, which she has imaginatively woven into her 
immersive performances, and upcoming novel, Galacta.i.ssance and the VNCCII 
Awakening.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
VNCCII, the alter ego of Samantha Tauber, is not just a musician; she’s a “Super 
Sentient A.I Superheroine” avatar from the intergalactic future. This fictional character 
not only serves as the central figure in VNCCII’s broader narrative but also embodies her 
artistic vision of fusing music with immersive storytelling.  
 
A rising force in the music industry, VNCCII blends pop, epic electronica, and cinematic 
soundscapes with imaginative sci-fi themes. Inspired by influential artists like Daft Punk 
and Michael Jackson, her music evokes deep emotions and deeply explores the human 
experience. VNCCII’s sound is a forward-looking fusion of futuristic electronica and 
acoustic instruments, creating a ‘Future Classic’ vibe that is both innovative and 
timeless. 
 



 
 
Over the past year, VNCCII has made a resounding impact in the worlds of both music 
and technology. On top of headlining events like the BRITS Week in Soho, she was 
honoured with the Music Metaverse Award at the Metaverse Entertainment World 
Summit in Monaco, a recognition that affirms her place as one of the most innovative 
artists in the digital age.  
 
As VNCCII continues to break new ground in the music industry, she is preparing for the 
release of her debut album and science fiction novel. VNCCII’s work connects art, 
storytelling, and music to the space industry, aiming to uplift humanity’s consciousness 
and create inspiring messages to send to space, positively progressing the future of 
humanity through technology. 
 
The music from her debut album will be sent to Deep Space January 2025 in an exciting 
partnership with LifeShip via a SpaceX Falcon 9 rocket. Her science fiction novel will 
also be memorialized on the Moon in 2025 in partnership with the company NanoFiche 
for NASA’s Astrobotic’s Griffin Lander Mission. NanoFiche is the archival of choice for a 
“million-year archive”, for its potential to last billions of years in space. VNCCII’s 
commitment to the space industry extends to her work at the Interstellar Foundation, a 
non-profit organization working on the next ‘Golden Record’ to Space.  
 
“I’m looking forward to sharing exclusive insights and sneak peaks from my upcoming 
debut music album, novel, and science fiction franchise at this year’s Web Summit. My 
mission to help uplift the consciousness of humanity and inspire humanity to embrace 
an abundance mindset. Creativity is an empowerment tool where we can become 
causal agents for our transformative future.” 

- Samantha Tauber (VNCCII) 
 
For more information, visit www.vnccii.com. 
 
About VNCCII:  
VNCCII is the alter ego of Samantha Tauber, a London-based multimedia artist, music 
producer, and singer-songwriter. Her work blends futuristic electronic music with 
cinematic storytelling, creating an immersive experience that spans music, live 
performances, and digital art. VNCCII’s upcoming debut album and novel, 
Galacta.i.ssance and the VNCCII Awakening, explores the intersection of technology, 
humanity, and the cosmos, inviting audiences to join her on a journey of self-discovery 
and empowerment.  
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Official Website 
Instagram 
X 
YouTube 
Facebook 

http://www.vnccii.com/
https://www.vnccii.com/
https://www.instagram.com/vnccii_official/
https://x.com/VNCCII_OFFICIAL
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCHYl-nfACf-ghcnRN_cjogg
https://www.facebook.com/vncciiofficial/?locale=en_GB

